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QUESTION 1

HOTSPOT

You have an on-premises SAP environment. Application servers run on SUSE Linux Enterprise Server (SLES) servers.
Databases run on SLES servers that have Oracle installed.

You need to recommend a solution to migrate the environment to Azure. The solution must use currently deployed
technologies whenever possible and support high availability.

What should you include in the recommendation? To answer, select the appropriate options in the answer area.

NOTE: Each correct selection is worth one point.

Hot Area:

Correct Answer:
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QUESTION 2

Which Azure service should you deploy for the approval process to meet the technical requirements? 

A. Just in time (JIT) VM access 

B. Azure Active Directory (Azure AD) Identity Protection 

C. Azure Active Directory (Azure AD) Privileged identity Manager (PIM) 

D. Azure Active Directory (Azure AD) conditional access 

Correct Answer: B 

 

 

QUESTION 3

Your company has an SAP environment that contains the following components: 

SAP systems based on SAP HANA and SAP Adaptive Server Enterprise (SAP ASE) that run on SUSE Linux Enterprise
Server 12 (SLES 12) 
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Multiple SAP applications 

The company plans to migrate all the applications to Azure. 

You need to get a comprehensive list of all the applications that are part of the SAP environment. 

What should you use? 

A. the SAP license information 

B. the SAP Solution Manager 

C. the data volume management report 

D. the network inventory and locations 

Correct Answer: B 

The SAP Solution Manager is a centralized robust application management and administration solution used to
implement, support, operate and monitor your SAP enterprise solutions, SAP Solution Manager is a platform providing
integrated content, tools, methodologies and access to SAP systems. 

Incorrect Answers: 

C: Data volume management is a framework that helps the solution operations team of an SAP-centric solution to
balance the need of business\\' access to a wealth of data and IT efforts to monitor and control data growth and to
minimize data volume. 

References: https://blogs.sap.com/2009/02/20/sap-solution-manager-overview-for-dummies/ 

 

QUESTION 4

You have an on-premises SAP landscape that contains a 20-TB IBM DB2 database. The database contains large tables
that are optimized for read operations via secondary indexes. 

You plan to migrate the database platform to SQL Server on Azure virtual machines. 

You need to recommend a database migration approach that minimizes the time of the export stage. 

What should you recommend? 

A. log shipping 

B. deleting secondary indexes 

C. SAP Database Migration Option (DMO) in parallel transfer mode 

D. table splitting 

Correct Answer: B 

Secondary indexes for very large tables can be removed from the STR file and built ONLINE with scripts after the main
portion of the import has finished and post processing tasks such as configuring STMS are occurring. 

References: https://techcommunity.microsoft.com/t5/running-sap-applications-on-the/very-large-database-migration-to-
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azure-8211-recommendations/ba-p/368146 

 

QUESTION 5

HOTSPOT

Your on-premises network contains SAP and non-SAP applications.

You have JAVA-based SAP systems that use SPNEGO for single-sign on (SSO) authentication.

Your external portal uses multi-factor authentication (MFA) to authenticate users.

You plan to extend the on-premises authentication features to Azure and to migrate the SAP applications to Azure.

For each of the following statements, select Yes if the statement is true. Otherwise, select No.

NOTE: Each correct selection is worth one point.

Hot Area:

Correct Answer:
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Box 1: Yes

Box 2: Yes Password hash synchronization is one of the sign-in methods used to accomplish hybrid identity. Azure AD
Connect synchronizes a hash, of the hash, of a users password from an on-premises Active Directory instance to a
cloud-based Azure AD instance.

Password hash synchronization is an extension to the directory synchronization feature implemented by Azure AD
Connect sync. You can use this feature to sign in to Azure AD services like Office 365. You sign in to the service by
using the same password you use to sign in to your on-premises Active Directory instance.

Box 3: Yes If your organization is federated with Azure AD, you can use Azure Multi-Factor Authentication to secure AD
FS resources, both on-premises and in the cloud. Azure MFA enables you to eliminate passwords and provide a more
secure way to authenticate.

References: https://docs.microsoft.com/en-us/azure/active-directory/hybrid/whatis-phs https://docs.microsoft.com/en-
us/windows-server/identity/ad-fs/operations/configure-ad-fs-and-azure-mfa https://docs.microsoft.com/en-
us/azure/active-directory/hybrid/how-to-connect-pta

 

QUESTION 6

HOTSPOT

You deploy SAP HANA by using SAP HANA on Azure (Large Instances).

For each of the following statements, select Yes if the statement is true. Otherwise, select No.

NOTE: Each correct selection is worth one point.

Hot Area:
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Correct Answer:

Box 1: Yes

Box 2: Yes

The SAP Azure Enhanced Monitoring Extension allows for collecting diagnostic data including OS and Application
performance counters from Azure VMs running SAP workloads.

Box 3: No

References:

http://www.deployazure.com/compute/virtual-machines/sap-azure-enhanced-monitoring-extension/

https://docs.microsoft.com/en-us/azure/virtual-machines/workloads/sap/azure-monitor-overview

 

QUESTION 7
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HOTSPOT

For each of the following statements, select Yes if the statement is true. Otherwise, select No.

NOTE: Each correct selection is worth one point.

Hot Area:

Correct Answer:

Box 1: No

To log in to a Linux VM with Azure AD credentials, install the Azure Active Directory login VM extension.

Note: Azure AD Connect is the Microsoft tool designed to meet and accomplish your hybrid identity goals.

Box 2: NO

Box 3: No
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References:

https://docs.microsoft.com/en-us/azure/virtual-machines/workloads/sap/deployment-guide

 

QUESTION 8

HOTSPOT

You have ah SAP environment on Azure that contains a single-tenant SAP NANA server at instance 03.

You need to monitor the network throughput from an SAP application server to the SAP HANA server.

How should you complete the script? To answer, select the appropriate options in the answer are.

NOTE: Each correct selection is worth one point.

Hot Area:
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Correct Answer:
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QUESTION 9

DRAG DROP

You plan to deploy multiple SAP HANA virtual machines to Azure by using an Azure Resource Manager template.

How should you configure Accelerated Networking and Write Accelerator in the template? To answer, drag the
appropriate values to the correct targets. Each value may be used once, more than once, or not at all. You may need to
drag the

split bar between panes or scroll to view content.

NOTE: Each correct selection is worth one point.

Select and Place:
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Correct Answer:
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Box 1: true

enableAcceleratedNetworking: If the network interface is accelerated networking enabled.

To further reduce network latency between Azure VMs, we [Micorosoft] recommend that you choose Azure Accelerated
Networking. Use it when you deploy Azure VMs for an SAP workload, especially for the SAP application layer and the

SAP DBMS layer.

Box 2: true

Write Accelerator should be used for the volumes that contain the transaction log or redo logs of a DBMS. It is not
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recommended to use Write Accelerator for the data volumes of a DBMS as the feature has been optimized to be used
against

log disks.

References:

https://docs.microsoft.com/en-us/azure/virtual-machines/workloads/sap/dbms_guide_general

 

QUESTION 10

This question requires that you evaluate the underlined text to determine if it is correct. 

You are planning for the administration of resources in Azure. 

To meet the technical requirements, you must first implement Active Directory Federation Services (AD FS). 

Instructions: Review the underlined text. If it makes the statement correct, select “No change is needed”. If the
statement is incorrect, select the answer choice that makes the statement correct. 

A. No change is needed 

B. Azure AD Connect 

C. Azure AD join 

D. Enterprise State Roaming 

Correct Answer: B 

AD connect, it\\'s not mandatory to have AD FS, you can use Password HAsh Synch or Passthrough Authentication, but
AD Connect is mandatory to synch you on-promises accounts to Azure AD References: https://docs.microsoft.com/en-
us/azure/active-directory/saas-apps/sap-hana-cloudplatform-identity-authentication-tutorial 

 

QUESTION 11

HOTSPOT

You plan to deploy two Azure virtual machines that will host an SAP HANA database for an SAP landscape. The virtual
machines will be deployed to the same availability set. You need to meet the following requirements:

Ensure that the virtual machines support disk snapshots.

Ensure that the virtual machine disks provide submillisecond latency for writes.

Ensure that each virtual machine can be allocated disks from a different storage cluster.

Which type of operating system disk and HANA database disk should you use? To answer, select the appropriate
options in the answer area. NOTE Each correct selection is worth one point.

Hot Area:

AZ-120 PDF Dumps | AZ-120 Practice Test | AZ-120 Braindumps                             14 / 22

https://www.pass4itsure.com/az-120.html
https://www.pass4itsure.com/az-120.html
https://www.pass4itsure.com/az-120.html


https://www.pass4itsure.com/az-120.html
2025 Latest pass4itsure AZ-120 PDF and VCE dumps Download

Correct Answer:

 

QUESTION 12

HOTSPOT

You have an on-premises deployment of SAP HANA that contains a production environment and a development
environment.

You plan to migrate both environments to Azure.

You need to identify which Azure virtual machine-series to use for each environment. The solution must meet the
following requirements:

1.

Minimize costs.

2.
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Be SAP HANA-certified.

What should you identify for each requirement? To answer, select the appropriate options in the answer area. NOTE:
Each correct selection is worth one point.

Hot Area:

Correct Answer:
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QUESTION 13

You have an on-premises SAP AnyDB deployment hosted on an operating system that is NOT supported in Azure. 

You need to migrate the deployment to Azure by performing a replatform and migration to SAP HANA. The solution
must meet the following requirements: 

Minimize administrative effort. 

Minimize downtime. 

What should you use? 

A. SAP Software Provisioning Manager 

B. SAP Software Update Manager 

C. Azure Migrate 

D. Azure Database Migration Service 

Correct Answer: B 
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QUESTION 14

HOTSPOT

You have an SAP production landscape that uses SAP HANA databases.

You configure a metric alert for the primary HANA server as shown in the following exhibit.

You have an action group shown in the following exhibit.

AZ-120 PDF Dumps | AZ-120 Practice Test | AZ-120 Braindumps                             18 / 22

https://www.pass4itsure.com/az-120.html
https://www.pass4itsure.com/az-120.html
https://www.pass4itsure.com/az-120.html


https://www.pass4itsure.com/az-120.html
2025 Latest pass4itsure AZ-120 PDF and VCE dumps Download

The amy_email is configured as shown in the following exhibit.
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For each of the following statements, select Yes if the statement is true. Otherwise, select No.

NOTE: Each correct selection is worth one point.

Hot Area:
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Correct Answer:

Box 1: No The period is 15 minutes. Only alerts or emails will be sent. Box 2: Yes Box 3: Yes

 

QUESTION 15

You deploy an SAP production landscape on Azure virtual machines that run SUSE Linux Enterprise Server (SLES).
You need to generate a report that details performance differences between instances of an SAP AS ABAP system.
What should you use? 

A. JMeter 

B. ABAPmeter 

C. Micro Focus LoadRunner 

D. SAP UI Speedtest Tool 

Correct Answer: B 

Use ABAPMETER in NetWeaver AS ABAP when you want to test the general performance/health of each instance in a
NetWeaver AS ABAP system. Incorrect Answers: 

D: The SAP UI Speedtest Tool is used to network bandwidth and latency. 
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The UI5 Speedtest Tool regularly checks your network connection and allows you to review the results via a UI5 web
interface. 

Reference: 

https://userapps.support.sap.com/sap/support/knowledge/en/2879613 
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